
From: adam wheatley <wheatleytreecare@hotmail.co.uk>  
Sent: 30 August 2024 15:19 
To: Sandy <sandy@mccaskie.net> 
Subject: Re: TREE WORKS HENLEY IN ARDEN 

 
Hi Sandy   
Pleasure to meet you. Total figure was £7,220for the tree work not including planning permission. Details 
below. 
  
Trees not accessible by vehicle will have logs stacked with chippings. 
 

 
Many thanks Adam 



Wheatley Tree Care 
 
 
On 16 Aug 2024, at 17:18, Sandy <sandy@mccaskie.net> wrote: 

Pleasure to meet you today. Total figure was £7,220 for the tree work not including planning 
permission. Details below. 

  

Trees not accessible by vehicle will have logs stacked with chippings. 

 

mailto:sandy@mccaskie.net

